
January -- June 2007 General Equipment

Item Description
Cross Arms

F'glass 15° Vertical Single Phase Pin Ins Bracket

2" x 18" Joslyn Part # 7781-118 or Eq. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $45.28 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $49.00 NO BID
F'glass Vertical Two Phase Pin Ins Bracket

2" x 48" Joslyn Part # 7781-448 or Eq. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $90.00 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $110.00 NO BID
Fiberglass Heavy Duty Deadend Arms

3" x 48" Joslyn Part # 7550-648 or Eq. Utilicor $216.95 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $220.65 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $234.48
Wooden Cross Arms

3 3/4" x 4 3/4" x 8 ft. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $33.25 Stuart C. Irby Company $35.00 Utilicor $39.80
3 3/4" x 4 3/4" x 10 ft. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $41.35 Stuart C. Irby Company $48.00 Utilicor $49.75
Braceless Deadend Crossarm Assemblies

8 ft. Aluma-Form Part # HD-DEA-86-EB-REA or Eq. Stuart C. Irby Company $242.00 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $289.84 NO BID
10 ft. Aluma-Form Part # HD-2DEA-108-EB-REA or Eq. HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $388.00 NO BID NO BID
Braceless Tangent Arms

8 ft. Pupi Part # TB3000096042 or Eq. Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $134.00 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $136.00 Stuart C. Irby Company $160.00
10 ft. Pupi Part # TB30000120052 or Eq. Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $154.00 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $156.00 Stuart C. Irby Company $184.00
0° Three Phase Cutout/Arrestor Bracket

Joslyn Part # 7510-53612XCB or Eq. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $121.55 NO BID NO BID
0° Single Phase Cutout/Arrestor Bracket

Joslyn Part # 7510-015XCB or Eq. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $39.55 NO BID NO BID
Primary / Secondary Hardware

Aluminum Straight Line Spring-Loaded D.E. Clamp, Type ADEZ, Anderson or 
Eq.
ADEZ-57-N 4 to 4/0 ACSR HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $7.78 Utilicor $18.85 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $19.00
ADEZ-116-N 336.4 to 954 ACSR Utilicor $26.84 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $27.34 Stuart C. Irby Company $27.80
Aluminum Angle Suspension Clamp, Anderson or Eq.

AAC - 301   0.198 to 0.732 in. Stuart C. Irby Company $8.45 Utilicor $9.45 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $9.70
HAS - 118   0.70 to 1.18 in. Utilicor $30.59 Stuart C. Irby Company $31.70 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $31.80
Aluminum Mechanical Stirrup, Type AHLS, Anderson or Eq.

AHLS - 024019 - E  4 to 4/0 ACSR Utilicor $11.23 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $11.30 Stuart C. Irby Company $11.50
AHLS - 954022 - E  336.4 to 954 ACSR Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $24.00 Stuart C. Irby Company $26.40 Utilicor $26.94
Bronze Hot Line Clamp, Type BC, Anderson or Eq. (Hot Line Clamp)

BC - 2/0    0.128 to 0.414 in. Stuart C. Irby Company $4.40 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $5.14 Utilicor $5.26
Aluminum Hot Line Clamp,  Anderson or Eq. (Hot Line Clamp)

S1530AGP    0.157 to 0.905 in. Utilicor $7.86 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $8.00 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $8.05
S1545AGP    0.939 to 1.490 in. Utilicor $24.42 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $24.85 Stuart C. Irby Company $25.30
Clevis Type Suspension Insulators, Porcelain Products or Eq.

84166 (AECI 84300) Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $7.00 Utilicor $7.56 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $24.00
Pin Insulators, F Neck, 1" Thread 15KV, NGK-Locke or Eq.

NGK-Locke Cat # HRAP - 175 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $3.40 Utilicor $3.47 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $3.93
Transformer Mounting Bracket, Chance or Eq.

Chance Cat # C212 - 0144 Utilicor $143.26 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $146.40 Stuart C. Irby Company $146.70
Chance Cat # DT7C1 Utilicor $146.68 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $150.75 Stuart C. Irby Company $150.95

LOW BID 1st Alternate 2nd Alternate
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January -- June 2007 General Equipment

Item Description LOW BID 1st Alternate 2nd Alternate
Conduit Standoff Brackets, Chance or Eq.

Cat # C6 - CSO - 12 Utilicor $20.57 Stuart C. Irby Company $21.10 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $21.45
Cat # C6 - CSO - 24 Utilicor $25.50 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $26.25 #N/A $26.25
Conduit Strap Kits, Chance or Eq.

Cat # CSTK - 2; 2 inch strap Utilicor $3.16 Stuart C. Irby Company $3.25 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $3.29
Cat # CSTK - 3; 3 inch strap Utilicor $3.39 Stuart C. Irby Company $3.45 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $3.55
Cat # CSTK - 4; 4 inch strap Utilicor $3.57 Stuart C. Irby Company $3.70 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $3.75
Cat # CSTK - 6; 6 inch strap Utilicor $4.53 Stuart C. Irby Company $4.60 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $4.70
Compression Lugs, Anderson Type VACL Only

VACL - 4/0 - 12BN Utilicor $3.69 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $3.75 Stuart C. Irby Company $3.80
VACL - 500 - 12BN Utilicor $4.88 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $4.90 Stuart C. Irby Company $5.00
General Use Bronze Connectors

Anderson/Fargo Vise Type Ground Clamp, Cat # GC - 207 Utilicor $3.23 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $3.25 Stuart C. Irby Company $3.32
Anderson/Fargo Bronze Parallel Groove Clamp, Cat # LC - 1602 Utilicor $17.13 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $17.25 Stuart C. Irby Company $17.55
Anderson/Fargo Bronze Terminal, 2-Hole Flat to Cable 1/0 - 500 Range. Cat # 
SWL - 050 - B2 Utilicor $22.70 Stuart C. Irby Company $23.25 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $23.30

Aluminum Overhead Line Automatic Splice, Full Tension, Fargo or Eq.

4 - 2 ACSR Cat # GL4042A Utilicor $5.19 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $5.24 Stuart C. Irby Company $5.35
1/0 ACSR Cat # GL406A Utilicor $6.32 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $6.36 Stuart C. Irby Company $6.48
3/0 - 4/0 ACSR Cat # GL4098 Utilicor $15.16 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $15.25 Stuart C. Irby Company $15.52
336.4 kcmilL ACSR Cat # GL411 Utilicor $16.36 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $16.48 Stuart C. Irby Company $16.75
477 kcmil ACSR CAT # GL413 Utilicor $21.03 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $21.20 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $21.41
Ampact Aluminum Taps for ACSR; Ampact Brand Only.

477 - 477  #1-602031-3 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $16.08 Stuart C. Irby Company $16.84 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $18.00
477 - 336.4  #1-602031-4 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $16.08 Stuart C. Irby Company $16.84 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $17.69
336.4 - 336.4  #602007 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $14.68 Stuart C. Irby Company $15.36 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $16.14
336.4 - 1/0 Copper  #602001 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $14.68 Stuart C. Irby Company $15.36 NO BID
4/0 - 4/0  #600466 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $2.32 Stuart C. Irby Company $2.45 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $2.59
3/0 - 3/0  #600459 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $2.27 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $2.32 Stuart C. Irby Company $2.45
4/0 - 1/0  #600458 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $2.32 Stuart C. Irby Company $2.45 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $2.59
1/0 - 1/0  #600403 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $2.32 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $2.39 Stuart C. Irby Company $2.45
4/0 - #2  #600411 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $2.32 Stuart C. Irby Company $2.45 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $2.58
Shells, Yellow HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $1.64 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $1.74 Stuart C. Irby Company $1.85
Shells, Blue HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $1.64 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $1.74 Stuart C. Irby Company $1.85
Pin Terminals, Underground Secondary/Service Type, Homac Only

Homac Cat # MPT - 2/0 - 125 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Homac Cat # MPT - 4/0 - 125 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Homac Cat # MPT - 350 - 125 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pole Top Pin, 20 in, 1 in Insulator Nylon Threads

Joslyn Cat # J740Z or Eq. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $5.73 Utilicor $5.74 Stuart C. Irby Company $9.70
Guy Wire And Related Equipment

Fibrglass Guy Strain Insulator, 15,000 Lb. Maclean Only.

Maclean Cat # GCTE - 15 -144 Utilicor $23.15 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $25.69 Stuart C. Irby Company $26.80
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January -- June 2007 General Equipment

Item Description LOW BID 1st Alternate 2nd Alternate
Maclean Cat # GCTE - 15 -12 Utilicor $9.89 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $11.03 Stuart C. Irby Company $11.37
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January -- June 2007 General Equipment

Item Description LOW BID 1st Alternate 2nd Alternate
PISA Anchor Helix Assembly

Chance Single Helix 10 in Diameter for 3/4 in Rod, 1-3/8 in Core. Cat # E1021633 Utilicor $14.79 Stuart C. Irby Company $15.00 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $15.58

Chance Twin Helix 10 in Diameter for 3/4 in Rod, 1-3/8 in Core. Cat # E1021637 Stuart C. Irby Company $34.35 Utilicor $35.90 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $37.86

Guy Wire, Galvanized Steel

3/8 Siemens Martin Grade, Coils per FT Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $0.22 Utilicor $0.25 Stuart C. Irby Company $0.25
7/16 High Strength Grade, Coils per FT Stuart C. Irby Company $0.31 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $0.32 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $0.34
Conductor, Overhead Secondary, Overhead Primary, Underground 
Secondary, Underground Primary, Miscellaneous Copper

#6 Duplex, Shepherd, 600 Volt, 90 Degree C Operation. Packaged in Coils. Per 
FT. Utilicor $0.27 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $0.31 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $0.33

#4 Triplex, Periwinkle, 600 Volt, 90 Degree C Operation. Packaged in Coils. Per 
FT. Utilicor $0.58 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $0.61 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $0.64

#1/0 Triplex, Neritina, 600 Volt, 90 Degree C Operation. Packaged in Coils. Per 
FT. Utilicor $0.93 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $1.09 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $1.15

#4/0 Triplex, Zuzara, 600 Volt, 90 Degree C Operation. Packaged on Reels. Per 
FT. Utilicor $1.82 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $1.95 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $2.04

#2/0 Quadruplex, Grullo, 600 Volt, 90 Degree C Operation. Packaged on Reels. 
Per FT. Utilicor $1.72 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $2.15 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $2.35

#4/0 Quadruplex, Appaloosa, 600 Volt, 90 Degree C Operation. Packaged on 
Reels. Per FT. Utilicor $2.42 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $2.87 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $3.03

#336.4 kcmil Quadruplex, Gelding, 600 Volt, 90 Degree C Operation. Packaged on 
Reels. Per FT. Utilicor $3.72 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $4.95 NO BID

#2 ACSR, Sparrow, Packaged on Reels. Per FT. Utilicor $0.17 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $0.19 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $0.20
#1/0 ACSR, Raven, Packaged on Reels. Per FT. Utilicor $0.25 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $0.29 #N/A $0.29
#4/0 ACSR, Penguin, Packaged on Reels. Per FT. Utilicor $0.49 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $0.57 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $0.60
#336.4 ACSR, Merlin, Packaged on Reels. Per FT. Utilicor $0.70 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $0.84 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $0.87
#477 ACSR, Pelican, Packaged on Reels. Per FT. Utilicor $0.87 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $1.16 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $1.21
#6 Underground Duplex, Claflin, Ruggedized or High Score. 90 Degree C 
Continuous Operation. Packaged on Reels. Per Ft. HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $0.49 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $0.52 NO BID

#4/0 Underground Triplex, Sweetbriar, Ruggedized or High Score. 90 Degree C 
Continuous Operation. Packaged on Reels. Per FT. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $1.55 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $2.10 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $2.38

#350 Underground Triplex, Wesleyan, Ruggedized or High Score. 90 Degree C 
Continuous Operation. Packaged on Reels Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $2.71 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $3.64 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $3.80

#4/0 Underground Quadruplex, Wake Forest, Ruggedized or High Score. 90 
Degree C Continuous Operation. Packaged on Reels. Per FT. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $2.35 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $3.02 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $3.10

#350 Underground Quadruplex, Slippery Rock, Ruggedized or High Score. 90 
Degree C Continuous Operation. Packaged on Reels. Per FT. Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $5.80 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $5.84 NO BID

Underground Residential Distribution Cable (URD), Concentric Neutral, Jacketed 
15 kV Class Cable, 1/0 Aluminum Conductor, Class B Filled Strand, 220 mil EPR 
Insulation, Copper Full Neutral Consisting of 16 - #14 Strands, with Insulating 
Jacket Over Concentric Wires. Cable Shall Be All EPR Construction. Okonite or 
Kerite Only. Price per Foot.

T & C Specialty Distributors, Inc. $2.16 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $2.43 Utilicor $3.15

#6 Insulated Soft Drawn Solid Copper Wire. Packaged on Small Spools. Per FT. HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $0.49 #N/A $0.49 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $0.67

#4/0 Insulated Stranded Copper Wire. Per FT. Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $3.70 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $4.00 NO BID
#350 kcmil Insulated Stranded Copper Wire. Per FT. HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $6.50 #N/A $6.50 NO BID
#500 kcmil Insulated Stranded Copper Wire. Per FT. Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $8.20 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $9.26 NO BID
#4 Bare Soft Drawn Solid Copper Wire. Per FT. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $0.62 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $0.62 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $0.65
#6 Bare Soft Drawn Solid Copper Wire. Per FT. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $0.39 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $0.39 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $0.41
#1/0 Bare Stranded Copper Wire. Per FT. HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $1.63 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $1.70 NO BID
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January -- June 2007 General Equipment

Item Description LOW BID 1st Alternate 2nd Alternate
Underground Equipment

Load Break Bushing Insert, 200 A, 15 kV, Cooper LBI. Cooper Only. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $31.15 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $33.39 NO BID
Load Break Elbow Connector 200 Amp, 15 kV, with Capacitive Test Point, 1/0 
Stranded Conductor, Cooper LE215C06TX. Cooper Only. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $32.32 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $34.63 NO BID

Horizontal Load Break Portable FeedThru, 200 Amp, 15 kV. Cooper LPF215H. 
Cooper Only Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $102.50 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $144.69 NO BID

Rotatable Loadbreak Feedthru Insert, 200 A, 15kV Class.  Cooper LFI215.  Cooper
Only. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $133.90 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $143.48 NO BID

Insulated Protective Cap.  15 kV Class. Cooper LPC215. Cooper Only. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $25.05 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $26.83 NO BID
Polywater Type HP Multipurpose Cleaner/Degreaser.  16Oz. Aerosol Can.  Cat # 
HPY-12 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $6.05 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $7.90 NO BID

Ploywater Cable Lubricant J or Eq.  In 5 Gallon Pails. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $48.95 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $63.00 NO BID
URD Cable Termination, Cold Applied, Jacketed Concentric Neutral Cable

Raychem 841360-000 TFT-151E-1/0 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $45.98 Stuart C. Irby Company $52.00 NO BID
Raychem 050920-000 TFT-153E-750 kcmil Stuart C. Irby Company $86.05 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $119.55 NO BID
Junctions

Loadbreak Junction, 200 A, 15 kV Class, Cooper Cat# LJ215C4U.  Cooper Only Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $139.65 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $149.64 NO BID

Fiberglass Pedestal with 350 kcmil Connectors

Secondary Pedestal.  Pencell Catalog # AG18HDX-L35 Stuart C. Irby Company $158.00 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $170.55 Utilicor $213.00
Grade Level Buried Cable Enclosure.  Pencell Catalog #   PEM-1010 Stuart C. Irby Company $83.00 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $88.00 Utilicor $107.73
Underground Equipment Continued

Fiberglass Box Pads For Single Phase Transformers.  Nordic or Eq.  Nordic 
Catalog # CBP-37-43-15A-MG-22X24 Stuart C. Irby Company $185.00 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $194.96 Utilicor $296.00

Sectionalizing Cabinet, 3-Phase, 200 A, 15 kV Class, Integrated Base, with three 4-
Way 200 Amp Loadbreak Junction Installed.  Western Power Prodcuts Cat # SPM-
540-47-M1-DF3-123J4

HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $1,675.00 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $1,758.00 NO BID

Sectionalizing Cabinet, 1-Phase, 200 A, 15 kV Class, Integrated Base, with one 4-
Way 200 Amp Loadbreak Junction Installed.  Western Power Prodcuts Cat # SPM-
320-41-MG-DF3-121J4

HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $700.00 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $729.50 NO BID

Conduit and Fittings

High Density Polyethylene Conduit, 3 in. Nominal Size, 3.5 in. Outside Diameter 
with 13.5 SDR, Black With Red Tristripe, 40 Ft. Lengths, Smooth Wall Outside 
With Oscillating Internal Friction Reducing Spiral Ribs.  Arnco or Eq. Per FT.

Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $1.25 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $1.32 Stuart C. Irby Company $1.36

High Density Polyethylene Conduit, 3 in. Nominal Size, 3.5 in. Outside Diameter 
with 13.5 SDR, Black With Red Tristripe, 40 Ft. Lengths, Smooth Wall Outside 
With Inside With Friction Reducing Lubricant Installed.  Carlon or Eq. Per FT.

Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $1.25 Stuart C. Irby Company $1.36 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $2.04

Schedule 80 PVC, 3 in., 10 ft. Sections Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $2.28 NO BID NO BID
Schedule 40 PVC, 3 in., 90 Degree Elbow, 18 inch Radius, With Belled End.  
Carlon or Eq. Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $12.80 NO BID NO BID

PVC Conduit Expansion Fitting, 3 in.  With Coupling End.  Carlon E9445L or Eq. Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $18.80 NO BID NO BID
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Item Description LOW BID 1st Alternate 2nd Alternate
Protective Equipment and Capacitor Equipment

S&C Positrol Fuse Links "QR" Speed

1 Amp HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $3.56 NO BID NO BID
3 Amp HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $3.56 NO BID NO BID
5 Amp HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $3.54 NO BID NO BID
10 Amp HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $3.84 NO BID NO BID
15 Amp HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $3.84 NO BID NO BID
20 Amp HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $3.84 NO BID NO BID
25 Amp HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $4.13 NO BID NO BID
30 Amp HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $4.13 NO BID NO BID
50 Amp HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $4.84 NO BID NO BID
75 Amp HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $5.98 NO BID NO BID
100 Amp HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $7.44 NO BID NO BID
125 Amp HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $8.48 NO BID NO BID
150 Amp HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $16.98 NO BID NO BID
Other Protective Equipment

Loadbuster Disconnect, 14.4 kV, 600 A Continuous, S&C Catalog # 4922R9ED1.  
S&C Only. HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $179.00 NO BID NO BID

Fuse Cutout, 14.4 kV, 100 A Continuous, Loadbuster, S&C Catalog # 
89021R10BD.  S&C Only. HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $57.79 NO BID NO BID

Fuse Tube, 14.4 kV, 200 A, S&C Catalog # 89571R11.  S&C only. HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $71.43 NO BID NO BID
Space Disconnect Blade, 14.4 kV, 300 Amp, S&C Catalog # 89621R10.  S&C 
Only. HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $52.84 NO BID NO BID

Loadbreak Cutout, 15 kV, 100 Amp Continuous, ABB Catalog # 279C790A03MP.  
ABB only. NO BID NO BID NO BID

Elbow Surge Arrester, 10 kV, 8.4 kV MCOV, 36 in. Lead Wire.  Cooper 
3238018C10M or Ohio Brass 6115090036. Utilicor $63.20 NO BID NO BID

Parking Stand Surge Arrester, 10 kV, 8.4 kV MCOV.  Cooper PSA215M10 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Heavy Duty Distribution Class Arrester, 10 kV, 8.4 kV MCOV.  With Insolator, 
Wildlife Protector and NEMA X-Arm Bracket.  Cooper UHS1005-0A1A-1BIA Or 
Ohio Brass 213709-7324 Only.

Utilicor $31.96 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $32.42 NO BID

S&C Omni-Rupter Switch.  14.4 kV, 900 A, Isulated Base, Cypoxy Insulators, 4586 
Connector Provision, Upright Hookstick Operated.  S&C Only.  Cat. # 147432R1-
H.  ED 710.

HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $3,125.00 NO BID NO BID

S&C Omni-Rupter Switch.  14.4 kV, 900 A, Isulated Base, Cypoxy Insulators, 4586 
Connector Provision, Vertical Hookstick Operated.  S&C Only.  Cat. # 147532R1-
H.  ED 717R1

HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $3,125.00 NO BID NO BID

S&C Omni-Rupter Switch.  14.4 kV, 900 A, Isulated Base, Cypoxy Insulators, 4586 
Connector Provision, Upright With Insulated Pipe Section.  S&C Only.  Cat. # 
147432R1-S1.  ED 711R2-S1.

HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $3,574.00 NO BID NO BID

S&C Intellirupter Pulsecloser, 15.5 kV, 630/800 A, 12500 AIC, Non-Disconnect 
Style, Upright- Crossarm Mounting, Standard Control Unit, Battery- Free Control 
Power Option, Power Module Fed From One Phase On Both Sides @ 60 Hz, With 
Wildlife Protection, With 10 kV Arretors, With 4581 Connectors, With 4450 Module 
handling Tool.  S&C Only.  Cat # 248112-C0-P0-P22-W1-N2.

HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $22,264.70 NO BID NO BID

Cooper Type V4L Single Phase Recloser, 14.4 kV, 70 Amp, B Curve, 0 Fast OPS, 
3 Delayed OPS.  Cooper Only.  Cat # KLV470B03. NO BID NO BID NO BID

Chance Electronic Resettable Sectionalizer, 15 kV, 70 A Continuous, 2-Count, 
Parallel Groove Clamps, Nema Bracket.  Chance Only.  Cat # C740-162PB Utilicor $594.20 NO BID NO BID

S&C Tripsaver Dropout Recloser, 15 kV, 4000 AIC.  S&C Only. HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $1,414.50 NO BID NO BID
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Item Description LOW BID 1st Alternate 2nd Alternate
Capacitors and Controls

Capacitor Bank, Pole Mounted, 3-Phase, 1200 kVAR, 95 kV BIL, Complete With 6-
Unit Rack, Control Power Transformer, 2-7620 Volt 2-Bushing 200 kVAR 
Capacitors Per Phase.  Cooper or Eq. 

Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $7,400.00 NO BID NO BID

Vacuum Capacitor Switch, Type VCS-1, 95 kV BIL, 200 A Continuous, 120 VAC 
Operating Voltage, Standard 5-Pin Receptacle for 3-Wire Control.  Cooper or Eq.  
Cooper Cat. # KVCS111.

Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $990.00 NO BID NO BID

S&C Intellicap Automatic Capacitor Control.  Standard Control Strategy. 4-Jaw 
Electric Meter Base Mounting.  S&C Only.  CAT # 238010-J40. HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $990.00 NO BID NO BID

S&C Intellicap Plus Automatic Capacitor Control.  Standard Control Strategy.  4-
Jaw Electric Meter base Mounting.  DNP 3.0 Protocol.  Ready For Freewave FGR-
115RC Radio.  Surge Arrester, N-Type Antenna Connector, Bottom Mounted.  Cat. 
# 238120-P0-R30-R99-J40.

HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $1,892.35 NO BID NO BID

Metering Equipment

Form 2S, Class 200, 240 Volt, 3 Wire, Cat # EA0100000000 Stuart C. Irby Company $26.50 NO BID NO BID
Form 2K, Class 480, 240 Volt, 3 Wire, Cat # EA1600000000 Stuart C. Irby Company $165.00 NO BID NO BID
Form 3S, Class 20, 120 Volt, 2 Wire, Cat # EA0G00000000 Stuart C. Irby Company $62.50 NO BID NO BID
Form 3S, Class 20, 240 Volt, 2 Wire, Cat # EA0H00000000 Stuart C. Irby Company $62.50 NO BID NO BID
Form 4S, Class 20, 240 Volt, 3 Wire, Cat # EA0J00000000 Stuart C. Irby Company $62.50 NO BID NO BID
Three Phase Solid State Electronic WattHour Meters (Landis & Gyr S4e Only)

Form 16/15S, Class 200, 120-480 Volt 4 Wire, Delta/Wye, Type AXS4e Stuart C. Irby Company $202.00 NO BID NO BID
Form 16/15S, Class 200, 120-480 Volt 4 Wire, Delta/Wye, Type RXS4e Stuart C. Irby Company $345.00 NO BID NO BID
Form 16/15S, Class 200, 120-480 Volt 4 Wire, Delta/Wye, Type RXRS4e Stuart C. Irby Company $486.00 NO BID NO BID
Form 16/15K, Class 480, 120-480 Volt, 4 Wire, Delta/Wye Type AXS4e Stuart C. Irby Company $412.00 NO BID NO BID
Form 16/15K, Class 480, 120-480 Volt, 4 Wire, Delta/Wye Type RXS4e Stuart C. Irby Company $555.00 NO BID NO BID
Form 16/15K, Class 480, 120-480 Volt, 4 Wire, Delta/Wye Type RXRS4e Stuart C. Irby Company $655.00 NO BID NO BID
Form 9/8S, Class 20. 120-480 Volt, 4 Wire, Delta/Wye Type AXS4e Stuart C. Irby Company $189.50 NO BID NO BID
Form 9/8S, Class 20. 120-480 Volt, 4 Wire, Delta/Wye Type RXS4e Stuart C. Irby Company $327.00 NO BID NO BID
Form 9/8S, Class 20. 120-480 Volt, 4 Wire, Delta/Wye Type RXRS4e Stuart C. Irby Company $460.00 NO BID NO BID
Meter Bases - "K" Base (Siemens Only)

K4UT, Single-Phase With Lugs Cat # 9810-9546 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $270.00 Stuart C. Irby Company $293.50 NO BID
K7T, Three-Phase With Lugs Cat # 9817-9504 Stuart C. Irby Company $404.90 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $410.00 NO BID
Other Misc. Meter Parts

Ekstrom Bladed Blank Meter Socket Cover Cat # 1-6002 or Eq. Utilicor $1.40 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $1.49 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $1.55
Ekstrom Service Disconnect Adapter Cat # SDA 45 or Eq. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $4.37 Utilicor $4.52 Stuart C. Irby Company $5.05
Ekstrom Handi Ring Meter Sealing Ring Cat # 10-9090 or Eq. Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $2.95 Utilicor $3.04 Stuart C. Irby Company $3.60
Meter Seals (Brooks Only)

Enduro Clear Body, Red Insert, 0.047" Stainless Steel, Regular Hasp, Round 
Body. Cat # 6081301-27 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $0.36 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $0.39 NO BID

Spring-Lok Red, heat Stamped With Slit Donut Cat # 6302000-X Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $0.14 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $0.15 NO BID
Spring Lok 4" Stringing Ring Cat # 6309999-4 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $6.45 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $10.50 NO BID
Toolless Roto Seal Cat# 74000XX-27 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $0.24 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $0.28 NO BID
8" Soft Stainless Steel Wire For Roto Seal Cat # 0004508 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $0.07 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $0.10 NO BID
Cable Seal 2000 Cat # 94000XX-C Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $2.44 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $3.00 NO BID

Single Phase, Solid State Electronic WattHour Meters, With Customer Supplied Company Number (Landis & Gyr Focus Only)
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January -- June 2007 General Equipment

Item Description LOW BID 1st Alternate 2nd Alternate
Current Transformers, Secondary Type, Molded, Outdoor, Pole Mounting 
Type (Itron Type R6SA Or Eq.)
100:5 RF 4.0  Cat # 92350-039 Utilicor $45.58 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $47.24 Stuart C. Irby Company $48.60
200:5 RF 4.0 Cat # 92350-004 Utilicor $40.25 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $41.35 Stuart C. Irby Company $43.50
400:5 RF 2.0 Cat # 92350-006 Utilicor $40.25 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $41.88 Stuart C. Irby Company $43.10

600:5 RF 2.0  Cat # 92352-019 Utilicor $56.00 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $56.80 Stuart C. Irby Company $58.50
800:5 RF 2.0 Cat # 92352-020 Utilicor $56.50 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $57.98 Stuart C. Irby Company $59.65

200 : 5 RF 4.0 Cat # 92355-010 Utilicor $65.40 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $66.15 Stuart C. Irby Company $68.05
400:5 RF 4.0 Cat # 92355-001 Utilicor $66.70 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $67.05 Stuart C. Irby Company $69.00
600 : 5 RF 3.0 Cat # 9255-003 Utilicor $66.70 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $68.83 Stuart C. Irby Company $70.80
800 : 5 RF 2.0 Cat # 92355-004 Utilicor $68.50 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $68.83 Stuart C. Irby Company $70.80
1000 : 5 RF 2.0 Cat # 92355-005 Utilicor $68.50 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $69.98 Stuart C. Irby Company $72.00
1200 : 5 RF 1.5 Cat # 92355-006 Utilicor $69.80 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $72.34 Stuart C. Irby Company $74.40
1500 : 5 RF2.0 Cat # 92355-007 Utilicor $73.20 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $74.66 Stuart C. Irby Company $76.80

800 : 5 RF 2.0 Cat # 92356-001 Utilicor $101.85 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $103.83 Stuart C. Irby Company $106.80
1000 : 5 RF 2.0 Cat # 92356-002 Utilicor $101.85 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $106.16 Stuart C. Irby Company $109.20
1200 : 5 RF 2.0 Cat # 92356-003 Utilicor $101.85 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $107.33 Stuart C. Irby Company $110.40
1500 : 5 RF 3.0 Cat # 92356-004 Utilicor $101.85 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $107.33 Stuart C. Irby Company $110.40

2.5:1 VT Pack Catalog# A6003012 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $367.00 NO BID NO BID
Transformer Rated Wiring Harness Cat # WH-STD-1 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $31.50 NO BID NO BID
Connector Cover Cat # Connector Cover Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $11.35 NO BID NO BID

10:5  RF 3.0 Cat # 7524A25G01 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $451.00 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $683.00 NO BID
15:5  RF 3.0 Cat # 7524A25G02 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $451.00 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $683.00 NO BID
25:5  RF 3.0 Cat # 7524A25G04 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $451.00 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $683.00 NO BID
50:5  RF 3.0 Cat # 7524A25G07 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $458.70 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $683.00 NO BID
75:5  RF 3.0 Cat # 7524A25G08 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $464.10 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $753.00 NO BID
100:5  RF 3.0 Cat # 7524A25G09 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $464.10 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $753.00 NO BID
150:5  RF 3.0 Cat # 7524A25G10 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $464.10 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $753.00 NO BID
200:5  RF 3.0 Cat # 7524A25G11 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $464.10 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $753.00 NO BID
400:5  RF 3.0 Cat # 7524A25G13 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $464.10 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $753.00 NO BID

60:1 Two Bushing Cat # 7525A89G05 (ABB VOZ-11 Or Eq.) Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $570.65 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $953.00 NO BID
60:1 Single Bushing Cat # 7525A95G01 (ABB VOG-11 Or Eq.) Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $516.30 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $783.00 NO BID

Itron Three Position TMD-3W Transrack Cat # 309611-000 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Itron Three Position QTMB Transrack Cat # WUI325015 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Barfield Three Position Transrack Cat # BA3CTVTR_BP NO BID NO BID NO BID

Barfield One CT and One PT Cat # BAPMM2 Stuart C. Irby Company $93.50 Utilicor $106.25 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $139.00
Barfield Three CT and Three PT Cat # BAPMM6 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $198.55 Utilicor $236.37 Stuart C. Irby Company $248.50

Current Transformers, Secondary Type, Molded, Outdoor, Pole Mounting Type (Itron Type R6M Or Eq.)

Current Transformers, Secondary Type, Molded, Outdoor Padmount Mounting (Itron R6P Or Eq.)

Current Transformers, Secondary Type, Molded, Outdoor Large Window Type (Itron R6L or Eq.)

Potential Transformers Secondary Type, Molded, Outdoor (Two Sockets - Two Meters Only)

Current Transformers, Primary Type, 15KV, Outdoor Type, Molded (ABB KON-11 Or. Eq.)

Potential Transformers, Primary Type, 15KV, Outdoor Type, Molded, 7200/12470 Wye, IEEE Meter Accuracy 0.3 W, X,M,Y,Z

Secondary Current and Voltage Transformer Racks

Primary Current and Voltage Transformer Racks
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January -- June 2007 General Equipment

Item Description LOW BID 1st Alternate 2nd Alternate

Power Moniotrs' Eagle 330 Power Quality Recorder Power Monitors, Inc. $3,810.00 NO BID NO BID
Power Monitors' Set of Three True Low Amp Dual Range 20/200 Amp Current 
Tranformers To Fit Eagle 330 Power Quality Recorder Cat # TLAR +200/3 Power Monitors, Inc. $1,150.00 NO BID NO BID

Power Monitors' Set of 24 in. Flex Current Transformers to Fit Eagle 330 Power 
Quality Recorder  Cat# FCT 3/24 Power Monitors, Inc. $855.00 NO BID NO BID

Lights and Lighting Equipment

400 W HPS, 480 V, Roadway Luminaire with Cutoff Optics, General Electric Part # 
MSCL40S5A12FMC3 Utilicor $125.00 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $137.00 NO BID

175 Watt Mercury Vapor Lights, Head Only, America Electric Part # 11 17V XN 
120 R5 B or Eq. Utilicor $22.70 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $29.50 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $29.80

250/400 Multiwatt HPS light, Roadway Luminaire, With Multivolt Option And Photo 
Electric Cell Receptacle, General Electric Part # MSRL24S0A22RMC3 or Eq. Utilicor $132.60 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $142.10 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $154.00

250/400 Multiwatt HPS Flood Light With Multivolt Option, Pole Mount And Photo 
Electric Cell Receptacle, General Electric Part # PF1S24S0A26X6DBP Utilicor $148.00 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $154.00 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $165.25

400 W HPS Interstate, 120 V Pole Mount With Photo Electric Cell Receptacle, 
American Electric Catalog # 285 40S CA MT1 R3 DA GY Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $344.90 Stuart C. Irby Company $378.00 Utilicor $380.00

6' Pole Mount 2" Steel Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $30.86 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $33.70 Stuart C. Irby Company $35.00
10' Pole Mount 2" Steel Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $56.70 Stuart C. Irby Company $60.70 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $61.50
10' Pole Mount 1.25" Steel w/ 34-36" Rise & A Single Tie Rod Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $52.75 Stuart C. Irby Company $56.50 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $60.48

105-305 VAC, 50/60 Hz, 1000W, 1800VA DTL(Dark To Light) Part # D124-1.5-
STM Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $4.30 Stuart C. Irby Company $4.70 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $4.98

420-520 VAC, 50/60 Hz, 1000W, 1800VA, DTL(Dark To Light) Part # DX480-11A Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $16.13 Stuart C. Irby Company $17.45 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $18.75

175 Watt Mercury Vapor HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $5.35 Utilicor $5.50 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $6.00
100 Watt High Pressure Sodium HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $8.05 Utilicor $8.10 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $8.75
250 Watt High Pressure Sodium Utilicor $8.27 Stuart C. Irby Company $9.90 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $9.95
400 Watt High Pressure Sodium Utilicor $8.27 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $9.36 Stuart C. Irby Company $10.00

Complete Package American Electric Part # 11PKG 10S RN 120 R5 BA or Eq. Utilicor $54.50 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $59.50 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $61.00

Head Only American Electric Part # 11 10S RN 120 R5 BA or Eq. Utilicor $23.86 Arkansas Electric Cooperative, Inc. $31.00 #N/A $31.00

1500 Watt 130 Volt CLR PS52 MOG Lamps Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $31.00 Utilicor $36.35 Stuart C. Irby Company $39.70
1000 Watt 130 Volt Metal Halite Lamps Stuart C. Irby Company $21.40 Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $27.50 Utilicor $28.00
175 Watt Metal Halite Bulb Garner-Lumley Electric Supply Co. $11.00 HD Supply - Ridgeland, MS $11.65 Utilicor $12.50
Poles

30 ft Class 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID
40 ft Class 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID
45 ft Class 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID
50 ft Class 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 ft Class 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID
60 ft Class 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID
65 ft Class 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID
70 ft Class 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID

100 Watt High Pressure Sodium

Light Bulbs

Wood Poles with CCA Treatment

Power Qaulity Equipment (Power Monitors Inc. Only)

Misc. Specialty Lighting

Street Light Arms

Photo Electric Controls

Lamps, Street Light
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January -- June 2007 General Equipment

Item Description LOW BID 1st Alternate 2nd Alternate
75 ft Class 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID
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January -- June 2007 General Equipment

Item Description LOW BID 1st Alternate 2nd Alternate

30 ft Class 5 Stresscrete Group $705.00 Newmark International, Inc. $1,785.00 NO BID
30 ft Class 2 Stresscrete Group $789.00 Newmark International, Inc. $1,785.00 NO BID
35 ft Class 5 Stresscrete Group $775.00 Newmark International, Inc. $1,835.00 NO BID
35 ft Class 2 Stresscrete Group $894.00 Newmark International, Inc. $1,835.00 NO BID
40 ft Class 2 Stresscrete Group $1,040.00 Newmark International, Inc. $1,895.00 NO BID
45 ft Class 2 Stresscrete Group $1,180.00 Newmark International, Inc. $1,960.00 NO BID
50 ft Class 2 Stresscrete Group $1,344.00 Newmark International, Inc. $2,025.00 NO BID
55 ft Class 2 Stresscrete Group $1,479.00 Newmark International, Inc. $2,090.00 NO BID
60 ft Class 2 Stresscrete Group $1,525.00 Newmark International, Inc. $2,165.00 NO BID
65 ft Class 2 Stresscrete Group $1,879.00 Newmark International, Inc. $2,250.00 NO BID
70 ft Class 2 Stresscrete Group $2,031.00 Newmark International, Inc. $2,315.00 NO BID
75 ft Class 2 Stresscrete Group $2,380.00 Newmark International, Inc. $2,525.00 NO BID

30 ft Class 1   (Single Arm Included) Lonestar Prestress Mfg. Co. $335.00 NO BID NO BID
35 ft Class 1   (Single Arm Included) Lonestar Prestress Mfg. Co. $395.00 NO BID NO BID

Single Arm Bracket Lonestar Prestress Mfg. Co. $105.00 NO BID NO BID
Double Arm Bracket Lonestar Prestress Mfg. Co. $195.00 NO BID NO BID

Concrete Poles - Circular / Octagonal

Concrete Poles - Square Prestressed w/Taper

Brackets - 6 ft Aluminum for Square Concrete Poles
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